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The Smoking Book is a dreamlike structure built on the solid foundation of two questions: how does it feel to
smoke, and what does smoking mean? Lesley Stern, in an innovative, hybrid form of writing, muses on these
questions through intersecting stories and essays that connect, expand, and contract like smoke rings floating
through the air.

Stern writes of addictions and passionate attachments, of the body and bodily pleasure, of autobiography and
cultural history. Smoking is Stern's seductive pretext, her way of entering unknown and mysterious regions.
The Smoking Book begins with intimate and vivid accounts of growing up on a tobacco farm in colonial
Rhodesia, reminiscences that permeate subsequent excursions into precolonial tobacco production and
postcolonial life in Zimbabwe, as well as dramatic vignettes set in Australia, the United States, Scotland,
Italy, Japan, and South America. Stern has written a book, at once intensely personal and kaleidoscopically
international, that weaves the intimate act of a solitary person smoking a cigarette into a broad cultural
picture of desire, exchange, fulfillment, and the acts that bind people together, either in lasting ways or
through ephemeral encounters.

The Smoking Book is for anyone who has ever smoked or loved a smoker (against their better judgment); it is
for those who have never smoked or for those who mourn the loss of cigarettes as they would grieve for a
lost friend. But mostly, The Smoking Book is for all those who are smoldering still.
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From reader reviews:

John Alfaro:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by simply
surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. Yes, by
reading a book your ability to survive increase then having chance to stay than other is high. For yourself
who want to start reading a book, we give you this The Smoking Book book as nice and daily reading
reserve. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Sarah Davis:

The book The Smoking Book has a lot details on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of gain.
The book was authored by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research prior to write this book.
That book very easy to read you may get the point easily after looking over this book.

Kristy Douglas:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Typically the book
that recommended to you is The Smoking Book this reserve consist a lot of the information with the
condition of this world now. That book was represented how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary
styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some investigation when
he makes this book. This is why this book appropriate all of you.

Luther Jensen:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library as well as to
make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or real
their passion. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to presently there
but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know
that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this The Smoking Book can make you sense more interested to read.
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