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Meet Nick Monday, a San Francisco P.I. who was born with a unique talent: the ability to steal other
people’s luck. All it takes is a handshake and Nick walks away with their good fortune, which he then sells
on the black market. But wheeling and dealing in destinies involves more than just eating Lucky Charms,
and lately, Nick’s own fortunes have taken a turn for the worse. That is until Tuesday Knight, a curvy
brunette with an irresistible offer, walks into his office. Tuesday is willing to pay Nick $100,000 to retrieve
her father’s stolen luck. That’s a lot of corporate cappuccinos, even for a caffeine addict like Nick. Problem
is, Tuesday’s dad is also the city mayor, the feds are turning up the heat, and a Chinatown crime lord is
holding all the fortune cookies—most of them bad. Throw in a couple of femmes fatales, a douche bag
vegan, and a mysterious albino luck poacher, and it all adds up to one inescapable truth: you can’t take
something from someone for nothing without eventually paying like hell for it. . . .
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From reader reviews:

Jean Proffitt:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a go walking,
shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or read a book called Lucky Bastard? Maybe it is to
get best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can more
intelligent than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have various other opinion?

Elisa Dumont:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. 1 activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you are ride on and with addition info. Even you love Lucky Bastard, you are able to enjoy both. It is fine
combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout
people. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Willie Adams:

This Lucky Bastard is great publication for you because the content that is certainly full of information for
you who have always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This book reveal it facts
accurately using great manage word or we can state no rambling sentences included. So if you are read the
item hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but
tough core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Lucky Bastard in your hand like
obtaining the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no book that offer you
world within ten or fifteen tiny right but this publication already do that. So , this is certainly good reading
book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt that?

Wanda Hardin:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Lucky Bastard can be the solution, oh how
comes? A book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand-new
era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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