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A love story, a mystery, and a memory guide, Past Forgetting shows a writer's determination to re-create her
life. Jill Robinson, novelist and author of Bed/Time/Story, wakes from a coma to discover she's lost her
memory and just about any sense of who she was. And is.

She likes the look of the man standing next to her bed, but doesn't recognize that he's her husband, Stuart.
What matters is that she feels safe around him. As she searches the house for her children, she is reminded
that her son and daughter are both grown with families of their own--how well did she ever know them? Can
you make up for a past you don't really remember?

It is Stuart who begins to fill in the details for Jill, including the fact that she's a well-known writer, although
when she meets with her doctors, they say she may never write again.

Against all odds, Jill Robinson retrieved her unique writing voice, and in this engaging memoir shows how
she does it. She takes us with her on her exploration of the connections between memory and creativity,
celebrity and anonymity, and loss and discovery. From her first tentative steps outside her house on Wimpole
Street to London's sleek West End. From a trip to Oxford to discuss memory with a professor to her amazing
voyage to Los Angeles on an assignment for Vanity fair which takes her back to the sixties world of
Hockney, Polanski, and Hopper, Jill forges new paths to memory.

In Past Forgetting, Jill Robinson rediscovers friendships she doesn't know she had: Robert Redford tells her
stories about her childhood; at John Lahr's London literary teas, she's reintroduced to the writer's world, and
Cary Grant offers her memories of her father, Dore Schary. And being with Barbra Streisand reminds her of
a time she doesn't quite remember: when her father was running MGM.

In her urgent voyage to redefine herself, Jill asks all the questions you've ever asked on the nature of
memory. Is recollection shadowed by emotion? Is memory an act of reinvention? Do people reinvent rather
than recollect? In Past Forgetting you'll find the answers and you'll meet a writer you won't want to forget.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Wing:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Sure, you can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a
go walking, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled Past
Forgetting : My Memory Lost and Found? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You already know beside
you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with their
opinion or you have additional opinion?

Richard Stratton:

The e-book untitled Past Forgetting : My Memory Lost and Found is the guide that recommended to you to
learn. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to a person. The language that author
use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of
study when write the book, so the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also could
get the e-book of Past Forgetting : My Memory Lost and Found from the publisher to make you far more
enjoy free time.

Ward Beaver:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, quick story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting Past Forgetting : My
Memory Lost and Found that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading
behavior all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world far better then how they
react when it comes to the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading habit only for the geeky
person but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for every you who want to start
reading as your good habit, it is possible to pick Past Forgetting : My Memory Lost and Found become your
own starter.

Cheryl Kirkland:

You may spend your free time to study this book this guide. This Past Forgetting : My Memory Lost and
Found is simple bringing you can read it in the park, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not get
much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you easier to read
it. You can save the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you
buy this book.
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